RESPONDENTS TO
Bid 18024

Ada County Sheriff’s Office Tahoe Equipment Purchase 2018

Divisions awarded in red

Setina $ 21,767.00
Santa Cruz $ 3,073.00
Premier Vehicle Installation, Inc. Havis $ 6,814.44
Lund $ 1,880.92
Whelan $ 4,299.00
Sound Off
Signal $ 21,301.00
ECCO $ 1,960.00
Setina $ 20,717.88
Santa Cruz $ 3,340.28
ERS, Emergency Responder Services, Inc. Havis $ 6,396.00
Lund $ 1,794.00
Whelan $ 4,032.00
Sound Off
Signal $ 22,772.97
ECCO $ 1,582.00
Setina $ 27,634.50
Dana Safety Supply Santa Cruz $ 2,917.40
Havis
Non-Responsive $ 510924
Lund $ 1,953.00




Whelan $ 4,097.00
Spund Off NO BID
Signal
ECCO $ 1,865.00
Setina $ 20,939.57
Santa Cruz $ 2,810.00
Territorial Supplies Inc. Havis $ 7,059.10
Lund NO BID
Whelan NO BID
Sound Off
Signal $ 23,212.90
ECCO $ 1,518.64
Setina $ 24,838.00
Santa Cruz $ 3,308.28
Boise Mobile Equipment (BME Upfitting, LLC) Havis $ 7.089.78
Lund $ 3,178.68
Whelan $ 3,879.12
Sound Off
Signal $ 23,325.16
ECCO NO BID
Setina $ 24,078.93
Santa Cruz $ 3,223.75
Havis $ 7,819.29
Idaho Communications LLC dba Day Wireless Systems | | [_und $ 2.447.40
Whelan $ 3,772.00
Sound Off
Signal $ 24,557.29
ECCO $ 2,465.00




SIRENNET

Non Responsive






